
Saint David Families,

 Happy New Year! As we step into the
excitement of 2024, we are thrilled to bring
you the latest updates and happenings at
Saint David Catholic School. January and
February are months filled with energy and
opportunities for growth, and our school
community has been buzzing with
activities and achievements.

In this edition, you'll find highlights from
our classrooms, insights into the wonderful
projects our students have been working
on, and a glimpse into the upcoming events
that promise to make these months
memorable. From academic achievements
to artistic endeavors, there's something for
everyone in our diverse and vibrant
community.
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We encourage you to stay connected, get
involved, and celebrate the spirit of learning
and collaboration that defines Saint David
Catholic School. As always, your support is
invaluable, and we look forward to making
the next two months extraordinary for our
students and their families.

Thank you for being an essential part of our
Wolfhound family. Here’s to a fantastic start
to the new year! 
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